
8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

TN0330100

7024 Mccutcheon Rd17-081414 8/20/2017   2:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 02:20 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 7024 Mccutcheon Rd. Terral Harrison 
reported that she got in a disorder with her boyfriend, Blake Smith, after leaving the Urban Grind club. She stated that he took 
her wallet and that she wanted to get it back. Smith was located on foot in the area and consented to giving Harrison's wallet 
back. He also gave her house key back, and the two parted ways.

4525 Hancock Rd17-081438 8/20/2017   3:45:00AM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/20/2017 at 03:55 hours, Officer Harvey, Charles (66485) reported a memo at 4525 Hancock Rd.   On scene police spoke 
to Ms. Hyatt who stated she thought she heard someone trying to get into her residence.  Police checked the residence and the 
area around it and everything appeared secure.  Ms. Hyatt was very thankful to police for checking things out for her.

2812 Morgan Ave17-081439 8/20/2017   3:53:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 03:53 hours, Officer Buttry (60658) responded to a disorder at 2812 Morgan Ave. Upon arrival police made 
contact with Mr. Mayes. Mr. Mayes was extremely intoxicated and gave several different versions of a possible theft of his wallet. 
Mr. Mayes did not make any sense and was told to call back when he sobered up and police would try to assist him.

4400 St Elmo Ave17-081470 8/20/2017   8:30:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/20/2017 at 08:34 hours, Officer Jacques Weary (60845) reported a memo at 4400 St Elmo Ave. I, Officer Weary#989, was 
dispatched to 4400 St. Elmo Ave on a suspicious vehicle parked in the area for several hours occupied and marked with 
confederate flag decals. Upon arrival I spoke with Mr. Kenneth Medley (suspect) who stated that he was parked there to attend 
church. The suspect was checked in the system and released.

1428 Jenkins Rd17-081491 8/20/2017   9:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 10:00 hours, Officer Moser (60250) reported a memo at 1428 Jenkins Rd. I spoke to Phillip Mitchell who stated 
he found a wallet in the grass at Heritage Park located at this address.

Police were able to locate the owner of the wallet and gave back the wallet.

No other information at this time.

2706 N Chamberlain Ave17-081498 8/20/2017   9:30:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/20/2017 at 09:46 hours, Officer Oister (66493) reported a memo at 2706 N Chamberlain Ave. 
Police located a stolen vehicle parked int he alley way behind the above address unoccupied.  Upon checking the residence 
police made contact with the current resident, Terrence Stallion who stated that he was home with his son.  Upon further 
investigation police spoke with Mr. Stallion's son, Tayshaun Stallion and his friends, Lamar Aumedon, Jaylen Vance.  All persons 
stated that they were unaware of the vehicle behind the house or who parked it there.  At the time of this report police can not 
determine if anyone inside the residence were involved in the auto theft.  No further at this time.

1501 Long St17-081513 8/20/2017  11:00:00AM 91Z Property Found



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/20/2017 at 11:15 hours, Officer J Niver (73511) responded to a Property Found at 1501  Long St. Upon arrival, Employees 
stated they found an abandoned Yeti cooler on the steps of their property. Unknown who owns the property and police took the 
cooler as found property and will turn it into CPD Property Room.

2816 Cannon Ave17-081525 8/20/2017  12:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 12:15 hours, Officer Cooke (76367) reported a memo at 2816 Cannon Ave. Upon arrival, Police spoke with 
Lashanda Birt who stated she had been in a verbal disorder with Vincent Mayes. Mr. Mayes was standing in Ms. Birt’s front yard 
when police arrived. Ms. Birt stated to Police she wanted Mr. Mayes to leave her yard. Police asked Mr. Mayes to leave, Mr. 
Mayes left and went to his residence. Police have nothing further at this time.

119 Hollyberry Ln17-081547 8/20/2017  12:15:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/20/2017 at 13:15 hours, Officer Cannon 1089 responded to an Auto Theft at 119 Hollyberry Ln. Once on scene I spoke to 
Mr. Ahmed Aldarwish who stated he went outside and started his vehicle to let it cool off. Mr. Aldarwish stated he didn't have any 
suspect information, unknown direction of travel. NIC number V769473228. Nothing Further.

511 O Neal St17-081562 8/20/2017   2:30:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 08/20/2017 at 13:17 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 511  O Neal St.   
I spoke with Dustin Smoote via telephone.  He says that he parked his 1996 Honda civic on the side of the street at a friend's 
residence about 0230 hours this morning.  He says sometime after that, an unknown party reached in through a partly open 
window of his vehicle opened it and stole his car title and the battery.

R52/D01

3801 Alton Park Blvd17-081578 8/20/2017   1:40:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/20/2017 at 14:11  hours, Officer R. Justice (68403) responded to a theft call at 975 E 3rd Street (Erlanger Hospital). Upon 
arrival, police spoke with Kimberly Oliver who stated she was stopped at a red light at the intersection of Alton Park Blvd and W 
38th Street when a black male walked up to side her window and started beating on it. The suspect shattered the glass and then 
opened the driver's side door. Mrs. Oliver stated he then grabbed her cell phone that was sitting on her lap and stepped back 
away from the vehicle. Mrs. Oliver stated she then sped away coming directly to the hospital to call police. She stated the 
suspect looked to be a younger male with a slender build. He had on a white t-shirt and a Cleveland Cavaliers hat. He was 
driving in a smaller white vehicle. Police searched the area but did not locate the suspect. No further action taken at this time.

 
 

101 W 21st St17-081670 8/20/2017   6:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/20/2017 at 18:35 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) reported a memo at 101  W 21st St. Upon arrival Police spoke with 
complainant, Patrick Meleney. Mr. Meleney stated the while he was at the Mapco at the above address he saw the same party 
who tried to sell him 40 dollar credit cards yesterday. He stated the party was in a silver Chevrolet SUV. Later Mr. Meleney called 
back and stated the party was parked at the 2600 block of Williams, Police drove by but did not see a Chevrolet SUV. Nothing 
further.

2000 E 23rd St17-081673 8/20/2017   6:15:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/20/2017 at 18:38 hours, Officer Ampthor (73492) responded to a Vandalism at 2000 E 23rd St. Upon arrival I spoke with 
Ms. Holly Zimmerle.  Ms. Zimmerle stated a party had come onto the property and kicked the door of room 275 damaging it.  The 
party was not allowed on the property.  The party had a possible name of Daniel Doss but it is unconfirmed at this time.  The 
party had gotten into an argument with the occupant of room 275 prior to the incident.  The party was seen kicking the door by a 
number of residence who were outside.  The party was described as a thin build black male wearing no shirt and blue jeans.  The 
party was last seen leaving the property in a burnt orange Ford ranger.  Ms. Zimmerle wished to have a report made at this time 
and would follow up after speaking with the owner of the property.  No further action was needed at this time.

400 N Market St17-081684 8/20/2017   4:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/20/2017 at 19:00 hours, Officer Warren (71993) took a report over the phone of a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 400 N 
Market St. I spoke with the victim Ms. Elizabeth Barnes, who stated she had met a black male in the parking lot of Publix grocery 
store to sell a phone( Iphone 6S). Ms. Barnes stated while the suspect was inspecting the phone, he ran off on foot from the area. 
Ms. Barnes stated she had found the party to purchase the phone online. No evidence to collect and no possible suspect 
information at this time.

4501 Fagan St17-081691 8/20/2017   6:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 19:25 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) reported a memo at 4501  Fagan St. Upon arrival Police spoke with 
Complainant, Patricia Lawson. Ms. Lawson stated she believed her sister-in-law wanted to move her belongings out of her 
apartment while she was not home, but she had no intentions of moving. Ms. Lawson stated she wanted Police aware of her lack 
in desire to move at the current time. Nothing further.

200 Market St17-081714 8/20/2017   8:48:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 08/20/2017 at 20:25 hours, Officer Lentz (77579) responded to a Property Found at 200 Market St. Police were flagged down 
at 200 Market Street in regards to a found wallet. Police transported the wallet to property (Property #17-3500).

 
 

 

7310 Standifer Gap Rd17-081733 8/20/2017   9:31:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 21:37 hours, Officer Stansberry (61910) reported a memo at 7310 Standifer Gap Rd. Upon arrival complainant 
is an employee of Community Options and stated she and patient Jessica Dunigan were previously engauged in a verbal 
disagreement. Complainant stated she notified police due to Jessica, would not follow instructions. The complainant notified her 
manager (Kiesha Howard) who responded and took control of the situation per their facility protocols. Mrs; Howard apoligized for 
the incident and sent Ms; Dunigan to her room and Ms; Cobb home for the remainder.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 
 

 

930 Douglas St17-081738 8/22/2017   1:43:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 08/20/2017 at 21:45 hours, Officer Marvin Perez (73513) responded to a Vandalism at 930 Douglas St. Ms. Sydney Bailey 
had discovered that her red Jeep was vandalized. She stated that she lost saw her vehicle intact at 0200 hours, and she just now 
observed her rear passenger cargo window smashed at 2100 hours. There is no known suspects to consider, there are no 
cameras in the parking garage of Douglas Heights apartments. No further.

2714 Belle Arbor Ave17-081740 8/20/2017   9:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 22:04 hours, Officer Corey Holloway (77647) reported a memo at 2714 Belle Arbor Ave. On arrival a home 
owner said that they saw a person jump a fence and run across a yard. Police searched the area unable too locate anything. EOR

312 N Highland Park Ave17-081747 8/20/2017  10:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 22:19 hours, Officer Charles Bramlett (66966) reported a memo at 312 N Highland Park Ave.  Upon arrival 
police spoke to the caller Tennille Allen who stated she called because she was in a verbal argument with her live in boyfriend 
and wanted police to order him to leave.  Police explained to Mrs. Allen her boyfriend had established residency, and then 
explained the eviction process.  Nothing further to report.

6065 Arlena Cir17-081774 8/20/2017  11:35:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/20/2017 at 23:37 hours, Officer Jeremy Williams (63838) reported a disorder at 6065 Arlena Cir. Upon arrival police spoke 
to Kiandra Strawter. Ms. Strawter stated that she had been in a verbal disorder with her ex boyfriend Brandon Staples. Ms. 
Strawter stated the two were arguing due to Mr. Staples having another female at his residence. Mr. Staples stated that she 
wanted Ms. Strawter to leave his residence. Ms. Strawter did leave without incident. No further.

 

1933 Hamill Rd17-081804 8/21/2017   2:17:00AM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/21/2017 at 02:18 hours, Officer Winkelman (75392) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 1933 Hamill Rd. Upon arrival 
I spoke with the clerk, who stated a customer had given him a $50 bill, and when he swiped his pen over it, it indicated that it was 
fake. The customer then left the building and left the scene. After Observing the bill, it stated on one side, "Motion picture use 
only". No suspect info and no further police action taken.

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

.

7310 Standifer Gap Rd17-081816 8/21/2017   3:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/21/2017 at 03:50 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 7310 Standifer Gap Rd. #815. Ariel High 
and a couple friends called police after High's ex-boyfriend Matthew Shahan caused a disorder at the apartment. High and one 
friend reported that they had been drinking tonight and had just gotten back from swimming somewhere. High stated that she's 
been with Shahan for less than a year and has been trying to get him out of her apartment in Georgia for over a month now. She 
acted as if she is scared of him and wants help getting away from him; however, she said that she gave him a ride to the 
apartment from Outback Steakhouse where she works with her roommates. I explained to her that she needs to take the 
appropriate actions she can take to avoid contact with him before police can assist her- things like asking him to stop calling and 
texting, and not allowing him into the apartment. The girls stated they will call police if Shahan returns to their apartment.

7111 Bonny Oaks Dr17-081824 8/21/2017   4:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/21/2017 at 05:00 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 7111  Bonny Oaks Dr. A caller asked police 
to go to this address and try to make contact with Brittany Stiles to see if she was okay. I made contact with Stiles father there 
and he reported that she was okay when she left the house earlier in the night. She was not on scene when I arrived.

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

310 Nelson Rd17-081848 8/21/2017   5:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/21/2017 at 07:00 hours, Officer Jeffery K Miller (71974) reported an assist a citizen at 310 Nelson Rd. Upon arrival I spoke 
with Mr Moises Randel who stated he and his friend Mr Pedro Ramirez were drinking alcohol at his home on Nelson Rd when Mr 
Ramirez asked him to take him home.  He stated that they were all too intoxicated to drive and would do so when they sober up.  
Mr Randel stated that Mr Ramirez then would not come inside the house and was last seen about 0500 hours lying in the 
driveway.  He said at approximately 0600 hours, they could not locate him but found his wallet, cell phone, pants and shirt 
outside in the driveway.  He then stated that Mr Ramirez was diabetic but did not take any medication to treat it and did not feel 
like he was endangered, only intoxicated and walked away.    At approximately 0801  hours Mr Ramirez was located inside the 
Rustic Village Apartments beside some outside A/C units in his boxer shorts and Tennis Shoes and was returned to Mr Randels 
residence.  No further Police action taken at this time.

2717 Rossville Blvd17-081887 8/21/2017  10:07:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 08/21/2017 at 10:15 hours, Officer E.Craw (60268) responded to a Vandalism at 2717 Rossville Blvd. Once there the 
manager Paula stated that the suspect Wanda Hamilton burned the sheets and mattress in room 111. The suspect was gone 
once I arrived on the scene. Ms. Paula stated that she would prosecute at a later time.

3225 5th Ave17-081899 8/21/2017  10:40:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/21/2017 at 10:45 hours, Officer E.Craw (60268) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 3225 5th Ave. Once there the 
victim Dowdell stated that someone came and cut hedr tag in half and took her sticker. The unknown suspect did damage/stole 
her tag.

900 Market St17-081941 8/20/2017   6:00:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/21/2017 at 12:45 hours, Officer M Holloway (24522) responded to a Theft from Building at 900 Market Street. Mr. Owens 
stated that he was at the EPB building and went to sleep in his wheelchair, when he woke up someone unknown had taken the 
charger from his wheelchair, there is no offender information.

 
 

 

 

2111 E 12th St17-081999 8/21/2017   4:11:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/21/2017 at 16:14 hours, Officer Silva (70787) reported a memo at 2111  E 12th St. Upon arrival I spoke with Brian Terrell. 
Mr. Terrell stated his neighbor Pascual Vargas has been backing his trailer up in to his back fence. Mr. Terrell showed me his 
fence which was a chain link fence. There was older damage to the fence which Brian stated was older damage. Pascual stated 
he has never backed in to the fence, and his wife helps him back his trailer in. At this time it was un determined that the damage 
was from a trailer. Mr. Terrell agreed to put up a camera to try and record Pascual backing up in to his fence. Both parties shook 
hands and left back to their homes. No further action taken.

936 Carriage Parc Dr17-082012 8/21/2017   4:35:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/21/2017 at 16:40 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 936 Carriage Parc Dr. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Renita Pollard. She said she needed police to stand by while she gathered some of her belongings. She said she and her 
husband Kevin Pollard are separating. Kevin was not on scene. Renita gathered her belongings and left. Nothing further.

2007 Skyline Dr17-082032 8/21/2017   5:45:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/21/2017 at 17:55 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 2007 Skyline Dr. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Kirtis Wilkinson. He said his next door neighbor Mark Barnes came over to his door earlier and started banging on it. He said 
Mark was carrying on about noise. Kirtis said there hasn't been any noise. Police spoke with Mark. He was told he was not to go 
on Kirtis's property anymore. Nothing further.

 
 

205 Island Ave17-082084 8/21/2017   5:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/21/2017 at 20:33 hours, PST Mcmahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 205 Island Ave at GPS. The 
victim said that she left her vehicle (Jeep) parked in the lot there at about 5:30 pm and the doors are open on it.  When she got 
back to the Jeep at about 7 pm, she discovered that her purse was gone from inside. This report was taken by phone.

5845 Brainerd Rd17-082088 8/21/2017   8:42:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 11:31  hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 
5845 Brainerd Rd.  I spoke with Officer Haxton of Emory University Security,  He supplied the information on the Dell latitude 
laptop previously reported stolen.

7710 E Brainerd Rd17-082095 8/20/2017   3:25:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/21/2017 at 21:07 hours, PST Mcmahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 7710 E Brainerd Rd at the 
victim's home. The victim said that he last had his gun in his car while it was parked at home yestereday around 3:25 pm.  The 
car stayed parked there until about 4:55 pm, when he got back in the car to go to the Movies at Northgate.  When he got back out 
to his car at the movies at about 8 pm, he discovered that the gun was gone.  He said that the gun could have been stolen at 
either place but his home was the first possible location of the incident. He said that it's possible one of the doors on the car could 
have been left unlocked. This report was taken by phone.  Nic# G944140660.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

200 Highway 27 Nb Nb17-082099 8/21/2017   9:31:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/21/2017 at 21:45 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) reported a memo at 200 Highway 27 Nb NB.  Upon arriving I 
made contact with Nicole Schneider.  Ms. Schneider was on the Northbound ramp of Hwy 27 from Manufacturers Rd.  Ms. 
Schneider stated she was walking  and wanted to know what part of Chattanooga she could walk too that would have the "nice 
people" in it.  She further stated that she was just really thirsty at while point she was given a bottle of water by Police.  She was 
informed that she wasn't allowed to walk on the highway due to it being a safety issue and she agreed, then she decided to walk 
to the 24 hour laundry mat on Cherokee until her dad could pick her up at a later time.  Ms. Schneider had no warrants and no 
further action was needed.  Nothing follows.

7707 Lee Hwy17-082138 8/21/2017  11:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/21/2017 at 23:50 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 7707 Lee Hwy. Aisha Gilbert reported that 
Mabel Li was in the lobby causing a disorder after finding out that her two night reservation at Motel 6 was canceled. Li stated 
that she called to cancel last nights stay yesterday, but she did not want tonight's reservation canceled. I suggested that she pay 
for her room tonight and address the issue with management during business hours tomorrow. She agreed to do that.

1200 E 3rd St17-082142 8/21/2017  11:40:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/21/2017 at 23:40 hours, Officer Charles Bramlett (66966) reported a memo at 1200 E 3rd St.   Police were patrolling near 
the 1200 Block of East 3rd St when they noticed a white male waking in the Alexian Brothers parking lot.  Police observed the 
business was closed and the male party appeared to be looking around on the ground and into vehicles.  Police spoke to the 
party who stated his name was Michael Pitts and that he was homeless and was looking for cigarette butts.  Police checked and 
found Michael Pitts was wanted for two no extradition out of state warrants and no local warrants.  Police checked the parking lot 
and observed no signs of criminal activity.  Police informed Michael Pitts not to be in the parking lot after hours and he left the 
area without further incident.

2201 E 23rd St17-082147 8/22/2017  12:15:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/22/2017 at 00:15 hours, Officer Kennedy (70777) reported a field interview at 2201  E 23rd St.  While I was at 2301 4th 
Ave I could hear someone yelling at the Hunan Wok, 2201  E 23rd St.  When I arrived I found a B/M laying on the table under an 
overhang.  When I made contact with him he identified himself as Shon Cross.  He provided his ID card .  He 
claimed he was taking a break from going to his residence on 13th Ave after mowing some yards earlier in the day.  He admitted 
he did have a few drinks.  From speaking with him and watching his overall movements, I did not feel he was intoxicated enough 
to be a danger to himself and the community at large.  He left area heading towards his residence.

 
 

 
 

5400 Lake Resort Dr17-082208 8/22/2017   7:15:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/22/2017 at 07:50 hours, Officer Lorin Johnston (42491) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 5400 Lake Resort Dr. 
The victim W/F Carolyn Brannon stated she was exercising and she returned to her 2016 Lexus and her rear window was broken 
out, her blk gym bag was stolen with a Kindle computer $100.00. A B/M was sitting in a dark Nissan Rogue, maybe Tn plate 
1254. No further at this time.

777 Shearer Cove Rd17-082210 8/21/2017   9:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/22/2017 at 07:33 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 777 Shearer Cove Rd.  I 
spoke with Karen Davies via telephone.  She says that sometime after 2130 hours last night, an unknown party entered her 2009 
VW Jetta and rummaged through it emptying the glove box and center console.  She says that the only thing taken was a ziplock 
bag of loose change she uses to feed parking meters.

R51/D01

1335 Hixson Pike17-082244 8/22/2017   9:23:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/22/2017 at 09:50 hours, Officer McCall (62872) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 1335 Hixson Pike. Upon 
arrival, officer McCall spoke to the victim Haley Fazio. Ms. Fazio said that she came home yesterday evening and found 
someone breaking up a toilet on the side of the road near her vehicle. Ms. Fazio said they are doing construction on the house 
next door and the toilet came from the dumpster from that house. Ms. Fazio said this mornign she found peices of the toilet 
around her vehicle and her back window broken out. Ms. Fazio spoke to the home owner next door and they came up with an 
agreement for the owner (Mike Cinelli) to pay for the window.

6602 Shallowford Rd17-082247 8/22/2017   9:34:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/22/2017 at 10:00 hours, Officer Greg Chambers (61882) reported a memo at 6602 Shallowford Rd.  Upon arrival police 
located Mr. Darrell Davis who was attempting to walk away from police when told to stop.  Mr. Davis was checked for warrants 
and found that he was arrested on 08-02-17 for disorderly conduct.  No warrants were on file and Mr. Davis was released.  No 
further needed.

920 Mccallie Ave17-082258 8/21/2017   5:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/22/2017 at 10:00 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 920 McCallie Ave.  I 
spoke with Jon Hemrick via telephone.  He says that overnight, an unknown party broke into a company owned 1998 Ford E150 
van and stole two window a/c units and a refrigerant recovery pump.  Mr. Hemrick says to gain entry, the unknown broke out a 
side window of the van.  He says he does not know the cost to replace the window.

R52/D01

3825 Hixson Pike17-082297 8/22/2017  12:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/22/2017 at 12:20 hours, Officer Mansell (39154) reported a memo at 3825 Hixson Pike apt 137. Ms Brown just wanted to 
report of a disorder between to special residents that resulted in the kitchen table being broken. No police action taken.

5940 Winding Ln17-082298 8/21/2017  11:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/22/2017 at 11:55 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 5940 Winding Ln.  I spoke with Barry 
Bangson via telephone.  He says that sometime during the night, an unknown party broke out the rear windshield of their 2010 
Ford Escape.  He says that the vehicle was not entered.  Mr. Bangson says he does not know the cost to replace the windshield.

R51/D01

1011 Gadd Rd17-082301 8/21/2017  11:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/22/2017 at 11:59 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1011  Gadd Rd.  I spoke 
with Amber Higgins via telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party pried open the door of her 2001  
Chevrolet Impala.  She says that the unknown stole a white gold necklace, 2 lottery tickets, a Kate Spade wallet and $15.00 of 
loose change from the center console.

R51/D01



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

1216 N Hickory St17-082306 8/22/2017  12:26:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/22/2017 at 12:19 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Building at 1216 N Hickory St.  I met with 
Jacqueline Husband in the PSC lobby.  She says that sometime after 29 July,, 2017, an unknown party stole her laptop computer 
from her mother's residence.  She says  that her mother is in poor health and a lot of people come and go.  She says there is no 
way to point out a suspect.   She says the laptop is an HP and valued it at $710.00
R55/D01

7455 Commons Blvd17-082308 8/22/2017  11:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/22/2017 at 14:26 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 
7455 Commons Blvd.  Madison Segar called in to add the serial number for the Macbook Pro Air 13 and a Vera Bradley soft 
sided pick and green lunch box.

R57/D02

7314 Shallowford Rd17-082336 8/22/2017   1:45:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/22/2017 at 14:05 hours, Sgt. Tomisek (61660) reported a memo at 7314 Shallowford Rd.  Arby's. Manager of Arby's, 
Melanie Mansfield, stated that an employee (Nabaha White) was being loud, cursing, and disturbing the patrons so she was told 
to go home. Ms. White said some more choice words and stated that she was never coming back. As she was leaving the 
parking lot, she kicked Ms. Mansfield's car but did no damage. Ms. Mansfield stated that she wished to ban Ms. White from the 
property. Ms. White later called in and was told by police that she was no longer allowed on the property.

1020 Runyan Dr17-082337 8/21/2017   8:00:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/22/2017 at 14:00 hours, Officer McCall (62872) responded to a Property Lost at 1020 Runyan Dr. Police were dispatched 
to Life Care Center of Red Bank on a lost property call. Upon arrival, officer McCall spoke to the employee Lexi Finkle. Ms. 
Finkle said that a resident of theirs (David Wright) had lost his folder full of his important documents. Ms. Finkle said that David 
carries them around with him and there is no telling where they could be on the property. Ms. Finkle said that David did not want 
to make a report on the matter, but their had to because of their policy. Offier McCall did speak to Mr. Wright about the issue and 
he did not seem to concerned about the issue.

1100 Gateway Ave17-082343 8/22/2017   2:11:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/22/2017 at 14:19 hours, Officer Mansell (39154) reported a memo at 1100 Gateway Ave. Mr. Scoggins stated that he 
came to do a car repair for an unknown person. Mr. Scoggins gave that person a price to fix the vehicle and went to order parts 
for the repair. He came back to the scene and asked for a 60 dollar diagnostic fee. The unknown person then drove off. No 
physical work was ever done.

2126 Cleveland Ave17-082377 8/22/2017   3:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/22/2017 at 15:31  hours, Officer L Gregory (71964) reported a memo at 2126 Cleveland Ave. Upon arrival I came in 
contact with Tamara Thomas who stated she needed to get her belongings from her ex boyfriend's residence at 2126 Cleveland 
Ave. Ms. Thomas stated her ex boyfriend, David Bins, walked away from the residence when she informed him she was coming 
over to get her things. I spoke with Mr. Bins at his fathers residence on Portland St and he agreed to give Ms. Thomas her things. 
No further police action was needed.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd17-082395 8/22/2017   4:30:00PM 23C Shoplifting



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/22/2017 at 16:39 hours, Officer Stansberry (61910) responded to a Shoplifting at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival 
complainant stated an unknown male possessed and concealed store merchandise and left without offering payment. 
Complainant stated the subject used a pocket knife to cut the security spider wrap and walked out the door. Complainant stated 
the subject left as a passenger in a red colored sport utility vehicle. At this time there is no further information available.

955 Boynton Dr17-082396 8/22/2017   4:30:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/22/2017 at 16:40 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 955 Boynton Dr.  
Upon arriving I made contact with the complainant Alice Cameron who stated she had been driving on Hwy 27 earlier in the day 
when a box flew off of a white truck in front of her, striking her front bumper.  Ms. Cameron stated that she didn't stop because it 
looked like cardboard and she believed it hadn't damaged her vehicle.  Ms. Cameron then stated that later in the day she noticed 
a dent in her bumper that had resulted from the box.  I did observe a large dent in the front bumper on the passenger side of the 
vehicle.  Nothing follows.

5348 Hwy 15317-082415 8/22/2017   8:00:00AM 240 Theft & Recovery/Passenger Vehic

On 08/22/2017 at 17:25 hours, Officer Warren (71993) responded to a Theft & Recovery/Passenger Vehicle at 5348 Hwy 153. 
Upon my arrival I made contact with complainant, Mr. Phil Dyer (Employee of Marshal Mize Ford), who stated he was contacted 
by Officer Phillips of the Roan County Sheriff's office about a vehicle that may have been taken from their dealership. The 
vehicle was located a few houses down from a known auto theft and it looked suspicious. Mr. Dyer stated they did have a vehicle 
matching the Vin number provided by Officer Phillips. Marshal Mize Ford was informed they may pick up the vehicle at any time 
with no holds. No further police action was taken.

5706 Highway 15317-082449 8/22/2017   4:58:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/22/2017 at 19:15 hours, Officer Warren (71993) reported a suspicious person at 5706 Highway 153.  Upon arrival I made 
contact with Mr. Watson who stated he was homeless and stayed in the area. Mr. Watson stated he was recently released from 
prison for auto theft, but has no intention of committing any more crime and is just waiting for his disability to be approved so he 
can stop pan handling. Mr. Watson was asked to leave the area because of an anonymous complainant. No further

 
 

 

2215 Hamilton Place Blvd17-082467 8/22/2017   8:19:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/28/2017 at 02:15 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2215 
Hamilton Place Blvd. On 8-28-2017 at 00:38hrs, I Officer Veloz 603 was on routine patrol in the area of 1664 Greendale Way 
when I spotted a red Kia Optima with a  young black male asleep. The vehicle matched the description of a stolen auto that was 
boloed on 8-27-2017. I made contact with the driver briefly, before he turned the vehicle on and sped off, almost hitting my 
persons. I lost sight of the vehicle as it sped around the corner of the apartment complex. According to one witness, the suspect 
jumped out on foot and ran into the 100 building breezeway. A perimeter was set up and K9 was called out. K9 tracked to a 
possible location of apartment 136, but could not be certain for 100% if the hit was for the suspect or dope. I contacted the 
magistrate's office to see about obtaining a warrant; for the apartment unit but due to the situation, he would not sign off on it. 
Vehicle was towed to the property location because of been the suspect vehicle of about 60 auto burglaries. Nothing further.

7707 Lee Hwy17-082492 8/22/2017   9:41:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/22/2017 at 21:50 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 7707 Lee Hwy. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Carolyn Kirby. She said earlier a black male wearing a grey shirt and shorts approached her daughter and started cussing at her. 
She said her daughter was leaning against a railing and the male put his hands on both sides of the railing around her daughter 
and continued cussing. He then walked around the complex cussing at other people. He then walked away. Carolyn's daughter 
was not present when she was talking to police. Carolyn believes the male left. Nothing further.

1330 E 3rd St17-082513 8/22/2017  11:17:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/22/2017 at 23:17 hours, Officer Charles Bramlett (66966) reported a memo at 1330 E 3rd St.  Police were notified by an 
employee of Speedway Matt Burkett that a white female has been panhandling for several hours in the parking lot and would like 
for her to leave.  Police spoke to the party who stated her name was Barbara Bailiff and she was waiting on her daughter to pick 
her up.  Police attempted to contact Barbara Bailiff's daughter but the number was disconnected.  Police checked and found 
Barbara Barliff was not wanted for any outstanding warrants.  Police informed Barbara Bailiff that Speedway no longer wanted 
her on the property and she left without further incident.  Nothing further to report.

2479 Bridge Cir17-082519 8/23/2017  12:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2017 at 00:15 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (66622) reported a memo at 2479 Bridge Cir. A caller reported hearing 
a disorder coming from apartment #305. I could hear an argument when I got close to the room, and I made contact with Kendall 
and Taylor Duffy at the residence. Both parties stated they were in an argument over where Taylor would sleep for the night, but 
both agreed to quit arguing and go to bed in separate rooms.

508 Winston Rd17-082531 8/22/2017  11:30:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 08:30 hours, Officer McCall (62872) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 508 
Winston Rd. Officer McCall was flagged down by a guy on a bike that had found items belonging to Leah Golden. Officer McCall 
called Ms. Golden and she said her vehicle was stolen and she had just located it down the street. Officer McCall met Ms. 
Golden in the 1400 block of Mississippi Avenue with her stolen vehicle. Officer McCall contacted NCIC and had them remove the 
vehicle as stolen.

2207 E 26th Street Ct17-082561 8/23/2017   5:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2017 at 05:50 hours, Officer Clayton Holmes (63819) responded to a disorder at 2207 E 26th Street Ct. Upon arrival, 
police spoke with Betty Freeman. Mrs. Freeman stated that her friend, Jack Melvin, would not leave her residence. Mr. Melvin 
was cooperative with police and left without incident. No further.

6121 Lee Hwy17-082564 8/23/2017   5:55:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 06:00 hours, Officer Dewayne Prater (60839) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 6121  Lee Hwy. Upon 
arrival police spoke with Mr.Bemjain Wade.  Mr Wade arrived at the local SpeedWay gas station around 0540hrs.  Mr. Wade left 
his vehicle running and doors unlock.  Mr. Wade walk inside the gas station to get some coffee.  When Mr. Wade return back to 
his vehicle he notice his vehicle riding down Lee Hwy going south.  Mr. Wade same there was a blue jeep following behind the 
silver vehicle when it left the gas station parking lot.  There are no suspect inforation at this time.

On 08/25/2017 at 09:23 hours, Officer  wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 6121  Lee Hwy. 

                        On 08-24-17 at approximately 0913 hrs. I, Det. M Rogers #925, was assigned case # 17-082564. Upon reviewing 
the case I spoke to the victim who had nothing further to add other than what was already reported. I then relocated to the 
SpeedWay and viewed the video footage - the video was of poor quality - no information could be gathered about the suspects or 
the suspect vehicle. Vehicle still shows stolen through NCIC. Due to the lack of suspect information this case will be suspended 
until further information is learned that would change that status. Efforts will continue in locating the vehicle. Manager is to 
contact me regarding a copy of the video - for the case file.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

602 Spring Valley Ln17-082589 8/22/2017  11:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2017 at 07:40 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 602 Spring Valley Ln.  I spoke with Mrs. Emily 
Hollis via telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, after 2330 hours, an unknown party entered both of their vehicles 
and rummaged through each.  She says there was nothing taken even though her husband had his laptop computer and other 
valuables in his vehicle.  She says this is the second time in a month and requested extra patrol.  I created a WATCH for this 
location and street, as she says others have had their vehicles broken into.

R51/D02

3742 W Abercrombie Cir17-082597 8/23/2017  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 08:09 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 3742 W Abercrombie 
Cir.  I spoke with Mrs. Alana Retseck via telephone.  She says that during the night, her husband's ( Nic Coulter) 2017 Toyota 
Tacoma was entered and rummaged through.  She says that the unknown took his antique hunting knife which has a 12 or 15inch 
blade in a brown leather sheath laced with leather shoe lace.  She says the knife is worth at least $120.00.  She says there was 
no damage to the vehicle and nothing else taken.

R51/D01

4139 Mountain View Ave17-082609 8/23/2017  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 08:37 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4139 Mountain View 
Ave.  I spoke with Dustin Carpenter via telephone.  He says that sometime during the night, an unknown party entered his 2006 
Jeep Commander and stole his state championship ring from the center console..  He says the ring is made of steel is silver in 
color, has a raised black stone with the shape of Tennessee on it with 3 small diamonds on the Tennessee.  He says the ring has 
his full name engraved on the inside .  He says that he is the coach for the Girls Field and Tack Team at Signal Mountain.

R51/D01

416 Tremont St17-082614 8/23/2017  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 08:38 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 416 Tremont St.  I spoke 
with Robing Parker via telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party entered her 2014 Toyota 4Runner 
and stole three pair of sunglasses.  She says one pair were black Rayban valued at #150.00 the second pair also Rayban brown 
in color $150.00 and the third pair Censace aviator style with large lens valued at $250.00

R51/D01

412 Tremont St17-082632 8/23/2017   4:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2017 at 09:04 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 412 Tremont St.  I spoke 
with Mr. Wendell Clowers via telephone.   He says that about 0400 this morning, an unknown party entered his 2014 Mercedes 
and stole what cash he had in the center console of the vehicle.  He says there was no damage to the vehicle and nothing else 
taken.

R51/D01

7421 Commons Blvd17-082642 8/23/2017  10:15:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/23/2017 at 10:20 hours, Officer LEE 807 (41759) responded to a Property Lost at 7421  Commons Blvd. SHERRI 
JEFFERS, HOME DEPOT, NEEDED A REPORT FOR A LOST 2018 STICKER ON ONE OF THEIR RENTAL TRUCKS, TN - 

. ELEMENT FLEET SENT THE STICKER TO THEM FOR THE TRUCK ON 07/05/2017, IT GOT LOST SOMEWHERE 
IN THE MAIL OR THE STORE. NO FURTHER.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

715 N Market St17-082654 8/23/2017  11:07:00AM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 08/23/2017 at 10:50 hours, Officer Jeff Kirk (60829) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 715 N Market St. I SPOKE TO 
BECKY DREW, WORKING FOR TN VALLEY FEDERAL CREDIT UNION.  SHE SAID THAT THEY HAVE EVIDENCE THAT 
BRANDON GALLO, AND A BLACK MALE KNOW AS DEMITRIUS WILSON USED STOLEN CHECKS TO OBTAIN $2900 
FROM THE TN VALLEY FEDERAL CREDIT UNION.  THEY ARE FOLLOWING UP ON THE CASE AND NEEDED A POLICE 
REPORT DONE.  R17 D17

7728 Hancock Rd17-082668 8/23/2017  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 08/23/2017 at 10:58 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 7728 Hancock Rd.  I spoke with Kevin 
James of Disney Learning Center.  He says that during the night, an unknown party(s) tried to break into the building.  He says 
the front door is dented, a side window is broken and there is other damage to the building.  He estimates that the repairs will cost 
$5,000.00.

R57/D01

2200 Hamilton Place Blvd17-082702 8/23/2017  11:53:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/23/2017 at 12:45 hours, Officer H. Cole (343) responded to a Shoplifting at the T.J.Maxx on 2200 Hamilton Place Blvd.  
Upon arrival, Police spoke to complainant Doerian Johnson who stated that he observed an unknown black male walk into the 
store, grab an arm full of clothes, run past all points of sale, and run out the door.  The suspect stole $1705.00 worth of 
merchandise.  Police believe this to be the same suspect from 17-082762 and 17-080400.  No further at this time.

On 08/25/2017 at 19:51  hours, Officer H. Cole (343) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Shoplifting at 2200 Hamilton Place 
Blvd.  This happened at the JC Penny at this address not the TJ Maxx.  No further.

7742 Lee Hwy17-082708 8/23/2017   1:14:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/23/2017 at 13:12 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Building at 7742 Lee Hwy.  I spoke with 
Melissa Love via telephone.  She says that she received her 2018 registration decal in the mail and left it on her desk at work.  
She says that she had not been in the office since Thursday 17 Aug. 2017.  She says that an unknown party has peeled the decal 
from the registration slip and left the slip on her desk..  She says she  has no suspect information.

R57/D01

3604 Brainerd Rd17-082728 8/23/2017   2:34:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/23/2017 at 14:45 hours, Officer Silveira (66499) responded to a Vandalism at 3604 Brainerd Road. Upon arrival Police 
spoke with the complainant, Darrell Ranson. He reported that early this morning he found his vehicle vandalized on the trunk and 
on the right passenger side door. Police noticed several scratches on both areas, but the complainant did not provide any suspect 
information. The vehicle was parked in front of his residence. Nothing further.

1900 Tunnel Blvd17-082754 8/23/2017   3:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/23/2017 at 15:45 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 1900 Tunnel Blvd. Upon arrival, police were flagged 
down by Sandra Rogers. Apparently, her son belived that she might be suicidal, stating she had taken several sleeping pills. 
Police asked Sandra if she had, and she stated that she took a few. She denied EMS stating that she did not need medics, and 
thats she just wanted her son, Brent Rogers, to move away. Police told her that they cannont force him out, and that she would 
have to have an eviction started. Police asked Sandra two questions just to be safe: (1) if she was suicidal, and (2) if she wanted 
to hurt herself or anyone else; in which she responded "no" to both answers. Police could not transport her against her will due to 
the fact that there was no evidence that she was in fact suicidal. She stated that she fell off her bed by accident, and that her son 
would not help her up. Police told her to contact police and dispatch if she started feeling strange or had suicidal thoughts. She 
stated that she would. Nothing further.

25 Cherokee Blvd17-082756 8/22/2017   6:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/23/2017 at 15:45 hours, Officer C. Mullinix (70789) responded to a Vandalism at 25 Cherokee Blvd.  Once on scene, 
Police made contact with Mr. David Taylor who said that two windows had been damaged at the Strauss Co. construction site.  
Mr. Taylor said that the two windows looked like they may have been hit with a BB gun pellet.  Police observed the damage, and 
a small round hole was in the glass of each window.  Mr. Taylor said that each window was approximately worth $300.

2200 Hamilton Place Blvd17-082762 8/22/2017   7:33:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/23/2017 at 15:30 hours, Officer H. Cole (343) responded to a Shoplifting at the TJ. Maxx on 2200 Hamilton Place Blvd.  
Upon arrival, Police spoke to complainant Doerian Johnson who stated that he observed an unknown black male would into the 
store, grab an arm full of clothes, run past all points of sale, and run out the door.  The suspect stole $1200.00 worth of 
merchandise.  Police believe this to be the same suspect from 17-082702 and 17-080400. No further at this time.

On 08/25/2017 at 19:48 hours, Officer H. Cole (343) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Shoplifting at 2200 Hamilton Place 
Blvd.  This happened at the JC Penny at this address not at the TJ Maxx.  No further.

712 Moore St17-082765 8/23/2017   4:20:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/23/2017 at 16:15 hours, Officer Hans Anderson (75367) reported a memo at 712 Moore St.  Upon arrival, police met with 
the complainant who informed police that she ordered a TV from Walmart.  The complainant stated that she received a message 
stating it had been delivered this morning, but stated that when she arrived home, it was not there.  No suspect information 
available.  No further police action required at this time.

917 Mountain Creek Rd17-082784 8/21/2017   9:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 08/23/2017 at 16:55 hours, Officer Warren (71993) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 917 Mountain Creek 
Rd Apt 2. Upon arrival I made contact with the complainant, Mr. Tallant, who stated some time between 08/21/2017 at 
approximately 2100 and 1200 on 08/22/2017 someone had taken his vehicle's registration plate off the rear of his vehicle. No 
known suspects or evidence to collect. The TN registration plate was entered in to NCIC as stolen-#P636327870. No further 
police action was taken.

4110 Shallowford Rd17-082790 8/23/2017   5:29:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/23/2017 at 17:20 hours, Officer Hans Anderson (75367) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 4110 Shallowford 
Rd.  Upon arrival, police met with the victim Demetrius Cosey who stated that on his way to work this morning, his rear bumper 
began to fall off his vehicle.  It was at this time that he noticed the rear bumper had been partially pulled off the vehicle.  Mr. 
Cosey stated that the only place the damage could have taken place is in the Walmart Parking some time last night.  Police did 
not see any dents, paint transferral, or other indications of a collision.  There was no suspect information, and no evidence that 
this was collision related.  Police observed the rear bumper disconnected from the plastic retainers on the rear passenger side.  
No further police action required at this time.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

303 Browntown Rd17-082803 8/22/2017   8:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/23/2017 at 17:55 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 303 Browntown Rd.  
Upon arriving I made contact with the complainant Frank Lyons who stated he had a heating and air unit sitting in his yard that he 
had planned on replacing his current unit with once the weather cooled down, and sometime between 8pm the previous night and 
12pm, it had been stolen.  I observed a patch of dead grass where the unit had been sitting on the ground.  Mr. Lyons had no 
suspect information due to him being asleep at the time of the incident.  Nothing follows.

 
 

 
 

1300 Roanoke Ave17-082841 8/23/2017   8:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2017 at 20:20 hours, Officer Brian McClard (71972) reported a memo at 1300 Roanoke Ave. Upon arrival I spoke with 
Andrea Carter.  She was driving a blue Ford Taurus   She stated the vehicle behind her hit her while she was 
stopped at the red light.  I then spoke with Christopher Reeder.  He was driving a white Chevy Van ).  He stated the 
light turned green and he began rolling forward.  He then realized the vehicle in front was not moving and so he stopped.  He 
stated he did not hit the vehicle in front.  I observed no visible damage to the front of the van.  The rear of the Taurus did have 
scratches on it but none were consistant with being hit directly from the back. M.s Carter stated there was a witness on the porch 
across the street that saw everything.  I made contact with a Joel Richards who stated he was outside during the event. He stated 
he did not witness anything because his back was turned when the event occurred.  I determined that no contact was made 
between the vehicle due to the lack of evidence.

122 W Main St17-082846 8/23/2017   8:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/24/2017 at 08:04 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 
122 W Main St.  I spoke with Jordan Chastain via telephone.  he provided the serial number for the IBM laptop computer stolen.

 
 

 



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

1600 Market St17-082892 8/23/2017  10:52:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/23/2017 at 23:02 hours, Officer LOCKHART (68408) responded to a Vandalism at 1600 Market St. Upon arrival, I spoke 
with the victim Mrs. Kristine Westgard; she stated she walked out of her place of work and found her rear passenger window 
smashed with a rock. She stated it didn't look like anything was taken from her car and if she finds out anything was taken then 
she will call in and add it to the report. No suspect information was obtained, however police believe it to be the same suspect 
from previous car break ins in the area. No further information at this time.

1011 Gadd Rd17-082913 8/24/2017  12:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2017 at 00:35 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) reported a unknown trouble at this location. The caller stated that he was 
upset because his wife divorced him and he was sad. The caller is known to be 441  and give several pseudo names like Alex or 
Matthew. When i located the caller at his residence and attempted to make contact he hung up phone with dispatch and did not 
answer the door. Nothing further.

 
 

26 E Main St17-082984 8/23/2017   6:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/24/2017 at 08:22 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 26 E Main St.  I spoke with Emily 
Collins via telephone.  She says that her 2016 Hyundai Tucson was parked on th side of the street.  She says during the night, an 
unknown party used a concrete block to break into her vehicle.  She says in the process the door was bent, window shattered and 
on the inside, the glove box was ripped open and the fuse panel was ripped open.  She believes the damage to the vehicle is well 
over $2,000.00.  She says there was nothing stolen, as she does not leave anything of value in her vehicle.

R53/D01

8443 Chambers Rd17-082990 8/24/2017   8:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2017 at 09:00 hours, Officer Moser (60250) reported a memo at 8443 Chambers Rd. I spoke to the complainant, Josh 
Huff who stated he is the property manager for a company that is owned by Bailey Properties. Mr. Huff was at this location to do 
some repairs and the tenant, Phillip Baker was not letting him do his job so Mr. Huff wanted to document the incident for the 
owner.

I spoke to Mr. Baker who stated he wanted to do the repairs himself and was afraid that Mr. Huff would throw his stuff away and 
would mess up what repairs he has already done.

No further at this time.

413 Stone Ridge Dr17-082991 8/21/2017  11:00:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/24/2017 at 08:30 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 413 Stone Ridge Dr. I 
spoke with Darren Hooper via telephone.  He says that Monday 21  Aug. 2017, around lunch time, an unknown party came onto 
his property and stole his Husqvarna self propelled front wheel drive lawn mower.  He valued the mower at $350.00.   Mr. Hooper 
provided pictures of the mower information, which were forwarded to the Pawn Unit.

R51/D01

4905 Angela Dr17-083043 8/24/2017  11:51:00AM 91Z Property Lost



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/24/2017 at 11:30 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Property Lost at 4905 Angela Dr.  I spoke with Erika 
Walker via telephone.  She says that in April of this year, she had a car crash which totaled her Kia.  She says the vehicle was 
towed to an unknown location by a district wrecker.  She says recently she received a citation in the mail for a traffic violation 
picturing a red pick up with the license plate from her Kia.

R53/D02

613 Over St17-083058 8/24/2017  12:23:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2017 at 12:22 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 613 Over St.  I spoke with Alexia Smith via 
telephone.   She says starting two months ago she received letters from a bank where someone had applied for a credit card in 
her name.  She says that application was declined due to incorrect social security number.  She says recently she received a 
letter from Regions Bank needing her signature to complete the application for a  credit card with them.  She says she called 
Regions and had that stopped.  She says that someone changed her email address on her Credit Karma account to where she 
could not log on. She says she has taken care of that.  She says that she has not suffered any financial loss as a result.  I 
explained to her about contacting the credit bureaus with the report number and the Fair Trade Commission for instruction on 
how to stop identity theft.

R 57/D02

3410 Amnicola Hwy17-083060 8/24/2017   1:00:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 08/24/2017 at 13:05 hours, Officer Fletcher (42495) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 
3410 Amnicola Hwy.   Dr. Wayne Faunteroy came to the police service center to report that he has located his 2011  Mercedes 
that was reported stolen in Georgia.  The vehicle was towed by United Wrecker.    The vehicle was taken out of N.C.I.C. No other 
police action needed.

7110 E Brainerd Rd17-083071 8/21/2017   5:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/24/2017 at 13:24 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 7110 E Brainerd Rd.  I 
spoke with Bobby Winnie of Hullco.  He says that they have an outdoor kitchen on the back side of the building which includes a 
Webber stainless steel gas grill with a pewter colored top.  He says between Monday and This morning, an unknown party(s) 
came onto the property and stole the grill.  He valued the grill at $700.00.

R57/D01

247 W 38th St17-083077 8/24/2017   1:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2017 at 13:51  hours, Officer Blakley (78345) reported a memo at 247 W 38th St. Investigator Grafe(328) recieved a 
call about Treanna Hayes and opened a case. Ms. Hayes reported that nude pictures of her at been going around on social 
media. It is unknown at this time of who circulated the photos. Investigator Grafe contacted Officer Blakley to make a report for 
Watson. Investigator Grafe is going to continue the investigation.

191 Chesnut St17-083112 8/24/2017   4:32:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/24/2017 at 16:30 hours, Officer G.Stroud (75386) responded to a Property Lost at 191  Chesnut ST. While visitng 
downtown the victim had lost her wallet. She believes it may have fallen out of her pocket while sitting down on a bench in the 
area of Chesnut St or Walnut St walking bridge.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 

  

 

702 Pineville Rd17-083143 8/24/2017   5:13:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2017 at 17:18 hours, Officer Kyle Moses (63161) reported a memo at 702 Pineville Rd. Upon arrival, I located subject 
James Kerr laying on the side of the road heavily intoxicated. HCEMS Medic 6 arrived on scene and transported him to the 
hospital.

1601 E 23rd St17-083150 8/24/2017   4:27:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 08/24/2017 at 16:48 hours, Officer VAN NESS (75389) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 1601  E 23rd St. 
Upon arrival Officer Van Ness spoke with the complainant, Ms. Romina Deangelo, who stated that she was working at 1601  E. 
23rd St. and when she went out to her vehicle around 1645 she noticed that the drivers side window was busted out and that 
someone had stolen her cd player.  Ms. Deangleo stated that she returned to work around 1600 hours, and noticed that damage 
around 1645 hours.  Police reviewed a video of the theft.  The video showed an unknown gray 4 door sedan pull next to the 
victims vehicle.  Approximately 10 minutes later, a person exits the passenger side of the vehicle, breaks the victims window and 
steals her cd player.  The suspect then got back into his vehicle and fled the scene.  The suspect's identity was concealed from 
the video the entire time, due to the fact that the victim's vehicle was blocking the view of the suspect.  The cd player that was 
stolen is of an unknown make, and approximately worth $100.  Nothing further at this time.

 



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 

 
.

 

 
 

 

  
 

 

3514 Lillian Ct17-083234 8/24/2017  10:20:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/24/2017 at 22:25 hours, Officer Alex Olson (66494) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 3514 Lillian Ct. 
Upon arrival I spoke with victim Alexandria Burney who stated she was inside her house when she heard a loud noise.  Upon 
inspecting her car she noticed that the rear bumper on the corner of the drivers side had been damaged.  The corner of the 
bumper was dented and scratched with damage to the paint.  Ms. Burney stated she had just had her car detailed and this 
damage was not present prior to this incident.  No suspect information available at this time.  Nothing further to report.

3929 Manor Rd17-083279 8/25/2017   2:28:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 02:35 hours, Officer Calvin Cooper (#877) reported a memo at 3929 Manor Rd. Upon arrival police checked 
the area for a disorder and did not locate anyone or anything that needed police action. Police were not given a apartment 
number or name of anyone.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

8001 Volkswagen Dr17-083305 8/24/2017   5:30:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/26/2017 at 17:16 hours, Officer Hans Anderson (75367) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
8001  Volkswagen Dr.  As I was on patrol on Wilcox Blvd, I noticed a gray Jeep Renegade stopped on the side of the road, 
appearing to be unoccupied, and blocking the right lane of traffic.  Upon checking the tag, I found the vehicle had been reported 
stolen on 8/25/2017.  I conducted a recovery of the vehicle and released it to Broome Wrecker Service, who has a contract with 
the vehicle owners -- Enterprise Rental.

4119 Hixson Pike17-083315 8/24/2017   6:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/25/2017 at 07:35 hours, Officer Martin (62436) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 4119 Hixson Pike. Upon arrival I 
spoke to the complainant, Ricky Dean, about the theft of a Landscape Associates work truck. Dean told me that sometime 
overnight someone stole an Isuzu 16' box truck used by the business Landscape Associates. Dean said the keys are kept in the 
door of the truck. In addition to the truck, Dean said the vehicle was loaded with commercial lawn equipment used on the jobs. 
Dean is in the process of compiling a list of property on the truck. The storage facility has cameras. At this time attempts are 
being made to get surveillance footage. The case is pending.

 

951 Boynton Dr17-083409 8/25/2017   1:18:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 12:35 hours, Officer Jeff Kirk (60829) WAS SENT TO 951  BOYNTON DR ON THE THEFT OF A TV USING 
CASE 17-083409.  I SPOKE TO EDITHEN TWITTY, HE SAID THAT HIS NEIPHEW CORY TWITTY, HAS STOLE HIS TV.   
EDITHEN SAID HE LET HIS NEPHEW IN HIS APARTMENT FOR A VISIT.  EDITHEN WENT TO ANOTHER LOCATION TO 
EAT, LEAVING CORY IN HIS APARTMENT.  IT IS UNKNOWN IF CORY TOOK IT OR WHEN CORY LEFT HE DID NOT 
SECURE THE DOOR AND SOMEONE ELSE HELPED THEMSELVES TO IT.  EDITHEN SAID THAT HE WILL MAKE SOME 
PHONE CALLS TO SEE IF THE TV WILL FIND ITS WAY BACK HOME.   IF NOT HE WOULD LIKE TO PROSECUTE CORY 
TO GET HIS 42'' FLAT SCREEN TV BACK.  NO OTHER ACTIONS WERE NEEDED AT THIS TIME.  R52 D2



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 
 

 

 

1271 Market St17-083451 8/25/2017   2:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 15:00 hours, Officer Condra (62183) reported a memo at 1271  Market St. I spoke with the complainant, Krue 
Brock, who was calling about a Buick Rendezvous, which was located on his property. Brock saw that a large piece of concrete 
had been used to break the passenger side window out of the vehicle. Expressway Towing was called to pull the vehicle, but 
wanted police to have a misc report made, showing that they were not the one who damaged the vehicle. The tag info on the 
vehicle is as follows: IL RS8204, GARDNER RANDALL E--MULT OWNER GARDNER LYNN M 622 E JACKSON AVE 
CHRISMAN IL 61924-1604 3G5DA03L36S535305 2006 BUICK UTILITY G635-7256-0309.

2007 Merlin Dr17-083467 8/25/2017   3:21:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 15:30 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 2007 Merlin Dr. An anonymous complainant wanted 
police to check on a Harry Swanger to make sure he was ok. Upon arrival police spoke with Mr. Swanger. He said he was ok. 
Nothing further.

 
 

 
 

1816 Gunbarrel Rd17-083514 8/25/2017   4:40:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/25/2017 at 17:01  hours, officer H. Cole (343) responded to a Call-in at 1816 Gunbarrel Rd On 08/25/2017 at 17:01  hours, 
Officer H. Cole (343) responded to an attempted MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1951  Gunbarrel Rd.  Upon arrival, Police spoke to 
complainant Skylar Pittman who stated that she was sitting in her car, a Ford Mustang, in the parking lot at 1816 Gunbarrel road 
waiting for an appointment.  Her vehicle has dark tinted windows and the engine was running.  A maroon Kia Optima pulled up 
next to her car and a black male with dread locks stepped out of the car and pulled on the door handle of her car multiple times.  
There has been an elevated number of vehicles being stolen in the Chattanooga area and due to the fact that the suspect would 
have had a hard time seeing if someone was sitting in the drivers seat and that the vehicle was running Police believe that the 
suspect was attempting to steal the vehicle.  When the suspect noticed that Ms. Pittman was sitting in the driver's seat he got 
back into the Optima and quickly fled the area.  Police searched the area for the vehicle and BOLO'd the vehicle to all channels.  
No further.

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd17-083523 8/23/2017   8:20:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/25/2017 at 1716 hours, Officer H. Cole (343) responded to a Shoplifting at the JC Penny on 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd.  
Upon arrival, Police spoke to complainant Doerian Johnson who stated that he observed 2 black females enter the store, take 
items of clothing off the shelves, walk past all points of sale, and exit the side door before getting into their vehicles and leaving 
the property.  The suspects stole $486.00 worth of merchandise from the store.  Mr. Johnson believes that Nadia Miller and 
Kiesha Miller might be the suspects but he is unsure at this time.  Police are going to set up a line up with Mr. Johnson at a later 
date.  No further at this time.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

702 Barton Ave17-083530 8/23/2017  10:00:00PM 90Z Other

On 08/25/2017 at 17:32 hours, PST Mcmahan (61444) responded to a Other at 702 Barton Ave. The complainant said that she 
last saw her car when she left it parked at home Wednesday night at about 10 pm.  The car stayed parked there overnight and 
the next day at about 11  am, she discovered that some items inside of the car had been moved around but nothing had been 
stolen.  She said there was no damage to the car and she had left the doors locked but one of the windows had been left cracked 
open. This report was taken by phone.

2100 Hamilton Place Blvd17-083537 8/24/2017   8:37:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/25/2017 at 1718 hours, Officer H. Cole (343) responded to a Shoplifting at the JC Penny on 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd.  
Upon arrival, Police spoke to complainant Doerian Johnson who stated that he observed 2 black females enter the store, take 
items of clothing off the shelves, walk past all points of sale, and exit the side door before getting into their vehicles and leaving 
the property.  Mr. Johnson believes that Nadia Miller and Kiesha Miller might be the suspects but he is unsure at this time.  Mr. 
Johnson is unsure how much merchandise was stolen at this time.  Police are going to set up a line up with Mr. Johnson at a later 
date.  No further at this time.

 
 

 

3700 Hemingway Dr17-083566 8/25/2017   7:00:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 08/25/2017 at 19:05 hours, Sgt Kendon Massengale (62201) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 3700 Hemingway Dr.  After leaving a call at 3728 Hemingway Drive, I checked the dead end of the street as 
requested by the complainant.  I observed a four door Hyundai backed into the dead end and the rear passenger door was open.  
The vehicle was not occupied, and I did not observe anyone around.  While checking the area, I located several items that I later 
found to be stolen from car burglaries.  I collected a purse, school identification, several bottles of medicine, and other items.  
The vehicle was confirmed as stolen per NCIC (V869552842).  Whites Auto towed the vehicle, and the reporting agency was 
notified of the recovery.  I was able to collect several latent prints off of the vehicle.  There is nothing further to report at this time.

 
 

7014 Mccutcheon Rd17-083581 8/25/2017   8:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 20:45 hours, Police responded to 7014 McCutcheon Rd for a disorder. Upon arrival, Police spoke to the 
manager, Wesley Harper, who stated he was having problems with a female requesting a key to a room to which she did not rent. 
Mr. Harper continued that he is not allowed to give keys to parties unless they are the registered guest. Police then spoke to the 
female, Shawntea Boyde, who stated her boyfriend rented the room for the two of them however he is at work and she needed 
items out of the room to go to work. Ms. Boyde also had her manager, Williejay Kalaukoa, with her who also left a shirt inside the 
room.
Police, again, spoke with Mr. Harper who stated he did go into the room and observed some marijuana inside. Police then went 
into the room and observed what appeared to be an extermely small amount of marijuana, possibly shake, in a tiny bag. The only 
items inside the room were a shirt on the counter and a black leather bag. Inside the shirt was Mr. Kalaukoa's TN Id and inside 
the bag was Ms. Boyde's ID. To resolve the issue, Police removed the items and returned them to the owners and they left the 
area. No further.



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

1345 N Concord Rd17-083588 8/25/2017   9:07:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2017 at 21:15 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 1345 N Concord Rd. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Robert Burns. He said his friend Arthur Valley has been staying with him and he now wants him to leave. Arthur got a ride and 
left. Nothing further.

205 S Moore Rd17-083612 8/25/2017  10:15:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/25/2017 at 22:20 hours, Officer Hans Anderson (75367) reported a memo at 205 S Moore Rd. Upon arrival, police met 
with the complainant, Jessica Daniel, who stated that when she arrived home at 2215 hours, she saw a young white male by her 
side door, appearing to kick the door.  As soon as the suspect saw the complainant, he took off running.  Police checked the door 
but there was no damage and no visible sign of mischief. Police checked the area for the suspect but did not find anyone in the 
area.

 

3924 Camellia Dr17-083695 8/26/2017   5:10:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2017 at 05:14 hours, Officer Alex Olson (66494) responded to a disorder at 3924 Camellia Dr. Upon arrival I spoke with 
Kanisha Akridge who stated that she saw her neighbors in a physical disorder.  She does not know their names and could not 
provide any information on the vehicle they left the scene in.  Nothing further to report.

1601 Market St17-083715 8/25/2017   6:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/26/2017 at 06:45 hours, Officer Smith (66970) responded to a Vandalism at 1601  Market St. Upon arrival police met with 
Mr. Luke Gawthrop. Gawthrop stated he parked his vehicle at this location around 6PM on 8/25/2017 and returned to it aourd 
640AM on 6/26/17 to find the passenger side window had been broken with a cinder block and the passenger side door had also 
been hit with the cinder block. The cinder block was seen lying next to the passenger side door of the truck on the ground. 
Gawthrop could not provide any possible suspect information at this time. There was nothing on scene to process at this time. 
Gawthrop stated he didn't notice anything stolen from inside the vehicle at this time.

 

3441 Wilcox Blvd17-083879 8/26/2017   4:40:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

On 08/26/2017 at 16:53 hours, Officer Brelsford (77566) reported a memo at 3441  Wilcox Blvd. Police spoke with an anonymous 
complainant who stated that she was walking in the area of Tunnel Blvd and Wilcox when a middle age man in a brown van 
pulled up and asked her to get inside. The complainant was unable to get a tag number for the vehicle. The vehicle was last seen 
in the area of Wilcox headed towards Shallowford Rd. Nothing further.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd17-083905 8/26/2017   6:04:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/26/2017 at 18:04 hours, Officer Dakota Layne (77578) reported a memo at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. Police responded to a 
delayed disorder at the Rue 21  upon arrival police spoke with Ms. Higdon who stated there was a disorder on 08/25/2017. Ms. 
Higdon stated that police was called 08/25/2017 for a shoplifter that was casing a disorder. Ms. Higdon stated that the same 
women returned to the store on 08/26/2017. Ms. Higdon stated that she confronted the women and they left the store Ms. Higdon 
called 911. Ms. Higdon stated that the women stayed in there vehicle until police entered the parking lot then fled at a high rate of 
speed the opposite direction. Police searched the area for the vehicle but could not locate. No further.

2220 Hamilton Place Blvd17-083920 8/26/2017   4:05:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/26/2017 at 19:06 hours, Officer Dakota Layne (77578) responded to a Shoplifting at 2220 Hamilton Place Blvd. Upon 
arrival police spoke with Ms. Almlie who stated that she witnessed 2 black males and a light colored female take an Go Pro with 
accessories and shoes.  Ms. Almlie attempted to stop all the people involved but was unable. All three of the theft suspects also 
took the shopping baskets that they was using in the store with them on the way out. The three suspects exited the store and got 
into a black car possibly a Chevrolet impala and left the area before police arrival. Police attempted to identify the suspects but 
was unable. No further.

1634 Mary Dupre Dr17-083932 8/26/2017   7:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/26/2017 at 20:45 hours, Officer Kerns (71970) responded to a Vandalism at 1634 Mary Dupre Drive. in regards to a sign 
that was damaged in a yard. Upon arrival, officers spoke to Paul Ritch who said he saw that his sign that he posted in his yard 
was damaged. He said he posted a sign warning others to stay of the yard because of a traffic crash that happened a while back. 
He said the glass from the vehicle is still in his yard and he does not want anyone getting hurt. He said he does not know who 
could have destroyed the sign, but wants to prosecute them if they are found. He wanted officers to fingerprint the sign, but it was 
unsuccessful. There is no suspect information at this time.

3725 Jenkins Rd17-083965 8/26/2017   4:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/26/2017 at 23:00 hours, Officer Ryan Lynn (73508) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 3725 Jenkins Rd. Upon 
arrival, I was met by victim Brittany Snoke. Snoke stated that she visited the incident location at approximately 1600 hours this 
evening. Snokes stated she left her doors unlocked while she walked in the store. Snokes stated she placed her wallet and car 
keys under the seat. When Snokes went to retrieve the items from under her seat, she was unable to find them. Snokes stated 
she did not have any suspect information and did not have any damage to her vehicle. Snokes stated the value of the key is 
$150.00 and the wallet was $12.00. The video from the location could not be viewed until the daytime manager arrives for shift. 
The call was closed with no further police action needed at this time.

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 



8/20/2017  12:00:33AM TO 8/26/2017  11:59:33PM

 
 

 
 
 

 
 

 

 
 
 

6312 Atlanta Ave17-084096 8/26/2017   5:30:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/27/2017 at 10:12 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 6312 Atlanta Ave.  I spoke with Mr. 
Malcolm Walker via telephone.  He says that he parked his 1988 GMC pick up truck on the side of the street in front of his 
residence yesterday at about 1730 hours.  He says this morning at or about 1000, he found that an unknown party(s) had busted 
the front windshield and the right side passenger window of his vehicle.  He says he knows of no reason that anyone would do 
this to his property and that he has not had any problems with anyone.  Mr. Walker says it will cost at least $500.00 to have the 
windows replaced.

R57/D01

6933 Lee Hwy17-084150 8/26/2017   2:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/27/2017 at 13:14 hours, Officer Clifton Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 6933 Lee Hwy.  I spoke 
with Derrick Howerton via telephone.  He says while working out at Gold's Gym, an unknown party entered his unlocked Cadillac 
Escalade and stole his wallet and its contents.  He says the wallet held 4 debit/credit cards which he has canceled.  He also says 
two pair of Calaz sunglasses were stolen.  Mr. Howerton says that there was no damage to the vehicle.

R57/D01

829 Reunion Dr17-084250 8/25/2017   3:00:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/27/2017 at 20:05 hours, Officer Dakota Layne (77578) reported a memo at 829 Reunion Dr. Upon arrival police spoke to 
Mr. Goldberg who stated that there has been cars stopping in front of his home and he thought that it was a private investigator. 
Mr. Goldberg stated that  the person appeared to be the same person that was with his mother when his sister was arrested in 
Georgia. Mr. Goldberg was informed how to obtain a order of from the court house. No further.




